The Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Fourth Amendment)
Act, 2015

Act 19 of 2016

Keyword(s):

Appendix, Bakery or Bake-house, Budget Grant, Building, Cesspool, the
Corporation, Councillor, Cubical Contents, Dairy, Dairyman, Dairy Product,
Dangerous Disease

Amendments appended: 19 of 2016, 9 of 2017, 10 of 2017, 42 of 2017, 51 of
2017, 52 of 2017, 53 of 2017, 7 of 2018, 21 of 2018, 53 of 2018, 65 of 2018, 70
of 2018, 75 of 2018, 18 of 2019, 36 of 2019, 1 of 2021, 6 of 2021

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

g 3, I’F 3] AR, ® o, R0%E/AVE R, Th 2RI [ g 3, ffwr : w9 Re.00

STHTEATUT SHHTH W3

EUBCT R EaNE
TeRTE, faariee afufam g TsauTer wenfue deid Ry F Feet faftaw sufor
fafr o =@ faurmwea e fadad (Fush saETE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporation and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Fourth Amendment) Act, 2015 (Mah. Act No. XIX
of 2016), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XIX 2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 7th May 2016).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

II of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
LI?SZ Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
1949. Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
Mah XL Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted in

of 1965. the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Short title and
and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial ©7"¢"
Townships (Fourth Amendment) Act, 2015.

AT AB-43I—2



R HERTY IMHA AU TR HET 1S, W 9, R0%E/AVNT R9, Ik W3¢
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

CHAPTER 11
AMENDMENT TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL

CORPORATION ACT
Amendment 2. Insection 16 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in sub-section III of
of Seocftml?l 106f (1), after clause (g), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :— 1888.

1888. “(h) has failed to submit to the Corporation a certificate of Assistant

Commissioner, certifying that,—

() he resides in a house owned by him and has a toilet in such
house and he regularly uses such toilet ; or

(i1) he resides in a house not owned by him and has a toilet in
such house and he regularly uses it or he has no such toilet but
regularly uses the community or public toilet :

Provided that, no Councillor on the date of commencement of
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Mah. XIX
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships ©f 2016
(Fourth Amendment) Act, 2015, shall be disqualified under this
clause, if he submits such certificate, within a period of one hundred
eighty days from the date of such commencement :

Provided further that, if the Assistant Commissioner fails to
take the decision in respect of such application within a period of
thirty days from the date of receipt of the application; the
application shall be deemed to have been granted and the Assistant
Commissioner shall issue such certificate accordingly.”.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL
CORPORATIONS ACT

fAmeEdmefll(‘; 3. In section 10 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in LIX of
o S o sub-section (1), after clause (), the following clause shall be added, namely :— 194%-

1949 “(k) he has failed to submit to the Corporation a certificate of the

Ward Officer of the concerned corporation, certifying that,—

(i) resides in a house owned by him and has a toilet in such
house and he regularly uses such toilet ; or

(i1) he resides in a house not owned by him and has a toilet in
such house and he regularly uses it or he has no such toilet but
regularly uses the community or public toilet :

Provided that, no Councillor on the date of commencement of
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Mah.
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships ggﬁ;’f
(Fourth Amendment) Act, 2015, shall be disqualified under this
clause, if he submits such certificate, within a period of one hundred
eighty days from the date of such commencement :

Provided further that, if the Ward Officer fails to take the
decision in respect of such application within a period of thirty days



HERTE A TS0 FAAEURUT HET A0S, § 9, Q0%E/ATME R0, Ih ]3¢ 3
from the date of receipt of the application; the application shall be
deemed to have been granted and the Ward Officer shall issue such
certificate accordingly.”.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND
InpusTRIAL TOowNSHIPS AcT, 1965

Mah. XL 4. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Amendment
of 1965. pgunchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1), after clause gg ;;;EOHXEG
(1), the following clause shall be added, namely :— of 1965.

“(m) has failed to submit to the Council a certificate of the Authorised
Officer of the concerned Council, certifying that,—

(i) he resides in a house owned by him and has a toilet in such house
and he regularly uses such toilet ; or

(i) he resides in a house not owned by him and has a toilet in such
house and he regularly uses it or he has no such toilet but regularly uses
the community or public toilet :

Provided that, no Councillor on the date of commencement of the
Mah. XIX  Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
of 2016.  Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Fourth
Amendment) Act, 2015, shall be disqualified under this clause, if he submits
such certificate, within a period of one hundred eighty days from the date

of such commencement :

Provided further that, if the Authorised Officer fails to take the
decision in respect of such application within a period of thirty days from
the date of receipt of the application; the application shall be deemed to
have been granted and the Authorised Officer shall issue such certificate
accordingly.”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJl SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT
PRINTING STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

HERTE IMEA ST
SATHUT HIT 3ATS

g 3, 3® ¢(3)] AR, AR 23, R0%0/9HT RR, I 233¢ [ g ¢ fooma : T0& R0.00

STHTANUT THHATER V¥

TTTehe AT
R faurmesm Afufaw T TSauTel et Feer TRy T hod fatrew s
fafa o = faummeeA SRt fadad (St aT).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. IX of 2017),
is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and dJudiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. IX OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 12th January 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra had promulgated the
Mah. Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Ord. Ig(f Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)

2016. Ordinance, 2016, on the 19th May 2016 ;

AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the
18th July 2016, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Bill, 2016 (L. A. Bill No. XXVI of 2016), for converting the said
Ordinance into an Act of the State Legislature, was passed by the Maharashtra
Legislative Assembly on the 26th July 2016, and was transmitted to the
Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

®)

HAT 3M3-T¥—2



R HERT I T SFETRT WA 316, FHART QR, 09/ R, Tk §3¢

AND WHEREAS thereafter, as the session of the Maharashtra Legislative
Council was prorogued on the 5th August 2016, the said Bill could not be
passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213 (2) (a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Ordinance shall cease to operate at the expiration of six weeks
from the date of re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after the 28th
August, 2016 ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in
session ; and the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances
existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action to
continue the operation of the provisions of the said Ordinance, for the
purposes hereinafter appearing; and, therefore, promulgated the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment and
Continuance) Ordinance, 2016 (hereinafter referred to as “ the said
Continuance Ordinance”) on the 30th August 2016 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Continuance
Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows :(—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY
Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
Commencement. 54 the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 19th May 2016.
CHAPTER II
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL
CORPORATIONS ACT
Amendment of 2. In section 5 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
section if"{;‘ig sub- section (3),—

(a) before the first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely :(—

“Provided that, after the commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act,
2016, in respect of the general elections to the Corporation, each of
the wards shall elect as far as possible four Councillors but not less
than three and not more than five Councillors, and each voter shall,
notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, be entitled to cast
the same number of votes, as the number of Councillors to be elected
in his ward : ”;

(b) in the first proviso, for the words “Provided that” the words
“Provided further that” shall be substituted.

Mah.
Ord.
XVI of
2016.

LIX of
1949.

Mah.
IX of
2017.



HERTE I T SFETRT WA 316, FHART KR, 09/ R, Tk §3¢
CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS T'o THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,
NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL
TownsHuIPs AcT, 1965

Mah. 3. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
XL of Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
1965 referred to as “the Municipal Councils Act”),—

(a) in clause (7),—

(i) after the words “a member of the Council,” the words “the
directly elected President” shall be inserted ;

(i1) in sub-clause (i7), the words “ a President of the Council or”
shall be deleted ;

(b) for clause (12), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :(—

“(12) “election” means an election to a Council or to the office
of the President, as the case may be, and includes any by-election;”.

4. In section 9 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (1), in clause
(a), for the word “Councillors” the words “the President and the Councillors”
shall be substituted.

5. In section 10 of the Municipal Councils Act, to sub-section (2), the
following proviso shall be added, namely :—

Mah. “Provided that, after the commencement of the Maharashtra

IX of Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

2017. Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016, in respect
of the General elections to the Council, each of the wards shall elect as
far as possible two Councillors but not more than three Councillors, and
each voter shall, notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2)
of section 14, be entitled to cast the same number of votes, as the number
of Councillors to be elected in his ward.”.
6. After section 51 of the Municipal Councils Act, the following section

shall be inserted, namely :—
Mah. “51A-1A. (1) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
gélgf Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016, in respect of
the General elections to the Council, subject to the provisions of section
51-1A, every Council shall have a President who shall be elected by the
persons whose names are included in the municipal voters list prepared under
section 11.

(2) Every person qualified to be elected as a Councillor under section
15 shall be qualified to be elected as a President at an election.

(3) Election of the President shall be held simultaneously with the
general elections of the Council and the procedure regarding holding of
elections to the Council shall, mutatis mutandis, apply to such election.

(4) If at an election, no President is elected, a fresh election shall
be held to elect a President, and if there is a failure to elect a President
at the fresh election, such vacancy may, notwithstanding anything
contained in this Act, be filled by election by the elected Councillors from
amongst themselves.

AT SMS-%— 23T

Amendment of
section 2 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendment of
section 9 of Mah.
XL of

1965.

Amendment of
section 10 of
Mah. XL of 1965.

Insertion of
section 51A-1A
in Mah. XL of
1965.

Direct
Election of
President.



Amendment of

HERT I T SFETRT WA 316, FHART QR, 09/ R, Tk §3¢

(5) Any person elected under sub-section (4) or (7) shall be deemed
to be duly elected at an election under this section.

(6) If, in the election of the President, there is an equality of votes,
the result of the election shall be decided by lots to be drawn by the State
Election Commissioner or the officer appointed by him for the purpose.

(7) If, during the term of the elected Councillors, there is a vacancy
in the office of the President due to any reason, the same procedure as
provided in sub-sections (1) to (6) shall apply and such President shall
remain in office only for the remainder of the term, for which his
predecessor would have remained in office but for such casual vacancy :

Provided that, if a vacancy occurs, which is within six months
prior to the date on which the term of office of the elected Councillors
expires, the same shall be filled in by election from amongst the
elected Councillors.

(8) In case of a dispute regarding election of the President, the
provisions of section 21 shall, mutatis mutandis, apply.

(9) The Collector shall convene first general meeting of the Council
within twenty-five days from the date on which the name of the President
and the elected Councillors is published in the Official Gazette after the
general election of the Council and the President. The nomination of the
Councillors under clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 9 shall be made
in the prescribed manner in this meeting.”.

7. In section 51A of the Municipal Councils Act, after sub-section (6),

section 51A of the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

Mah. XL of 1965.

Amendment of

“(6A) In respect of the Councils to which the President is directly
elected after the commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016, the
provisions of this section shall apply with the following modifications :(—

(i) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :(—

“(1) Every Council shall have a Vice- President, who shall
be elected by the elected Councillors amongst themselves in
the first general meeting convened under sub-section (9) of
section 51A-1A.”;

(it) for sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :(—

“(6) Subject to the provisions of section 55A and other
provisions of this Act, the Vice-President shall hold the office
for a term of five years from the date of his election and his term
shall be co-terminus with the term of the Council.”.”.

8. In section 51B of the Municipal Councils Act, after sub-section (3),

section 51 B of the following sub-section shall be added, namely :—

Mah. XL of 1965.

Amendment of
section 52 of
Mah. XL of 1965.

“(4) The provisions of this section shall not apply when the President
is elected under section 51A-1A.”.

9. Section 52 of the Municipal Councils Act shall be re-numbered as

sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, the
following sub-sections shall be added, namely :—

“(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), the term
of office of the President, elected under sub-section (1) of section 51A-
1A, shall be of five years and shall be co-terminus with the term of the
Council.

Mah.
IX of
2017.



Mah.
IX of
2017.

HERTE I T SFETRT WA 316, FHART KR, 09/ R, Tk §3¢

(3) Nothing in sub-section (2) shall apply to the term of office of the
Presidents who are holding the office in respect of the Council for which
general elections have been held prior to the date of commencement of
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act,
2016 and the provisions of this section, as it existed on the date
immediately preceding such date of commencement, shall continue to
apply in respect of the term of office of such Presidents.”.

10. In section 55 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (1), for

the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :(—

“ Provided that, no such resolution shall be moved within a period
of two years from the date of election of the directly elected President
and in case of the President elected by the Councillors from amongst
themselves, within one year from the date of such election.”.

11. After section 341B of the Municipal Councils Act, the following

sections shall be inserted, namely :—

“341B-1. (1) Subject to the provisions of section 51-1A, every
Nagar Panchayat shall have a President who shall be elected by the
elected Councillors from amongst themselves.

(2) The Collector shall, within twenty-five days from the date on
which the names of the Councillors elected to Nagar Panchayat are
published or, as the case may be, first published under sub-section (1) of
section 19, in the Official Gazette, convene a special meeting of the
Councillors for election of a President :

Provided that, a meeting under this section shall not be held before
the expiry of the term of office of the outgoing Councillors.

(3) The meeting called under sub-section (2) shall be presided over
by the Collector or such officer as the Collector may by order in writing
appoint in this behalf. The Collector or such officer shall, when presiding
over such meeting, have the same powers as the President of a Nagar
Panchayat when presiding over a meeting of the Nagar Panchayat has,
but shall not have the right to vote :

Provided that, notwithstanding anything contained in this Act for
regulating the procedure at meetings (including the quorum required
thereat), the Collector or the officer presiding over such meeting may,
for reasons which in his opinion are sufficient, refuse to adjourn such
meeting.

(4) Any Councillor aggrieved by any decision of the Collector or such
officer, accepting or rejecting any nomination paper, may, within forty-
eight hours from intimation of such decision, present an appeal to the
Regional Director of Municipal Administration concerned and
simultaneously give notice of such appeal to the Collector or such officer.
Such appeal shall be disposed of by the Regional Director, as
expeditiously as possible, after giving a reasonable opportunity of being
heard to the parties concerned. The decision of the Regional Director
on such appeal, and subject only to such decision (if any), the decision of
the Collector or such officer, as the case may be, accepting or not, shall
not be called in question in any Court.

Amendment of
section 55 of
Mah. XL of 1965.

Insertion of
sections 341B-1
to 341 B-6 in
Mah. XL of 1965.

Election of
President of
Nagar
Panchayat.



Election of
Vice-
President of
Nagar
Panchayat.

HERT I T SFETRT WA 316, FHART QR, 09/ R, Tk §3¢

(5) If, in the election of the President there is an equality of votes,
the result of the election shall be decided by lots to be drawn in the
presence of the Collector or the officer presiding in such manner as he
may determine.

(6) Any dispute regarding election of the President shall be referred
to the State Government whose decision in that behalf shall be final.

(7) After election of the President, the Nagar Panchayat shall
continue its meeting for the purpose of electing the Vice-President.

(8) If there is a vacancy in the office of the President due to any
reason whatsoever, then for subsequent election of a President, the same
procedure as laid down in sub-sections (2) to (6) (both inclusive) shall
apply except that the special meeting shall be called by the Collector
within twenty-five days from the date on which the vacancy occurs.

(9) The subsequent election to the post of the President after expiry
of the first term of the two and a half years of the President elected under
the provisions of sub-section (2), shall be held within a period of eight
days prior to the expiry of the said term of the earlier President :

Provided that, the newly elected President shall take charge on
the last day of the term of the outgoing President or next day thereafter.

341B-2. (1) Every Nagar Panchayat shall have a Vice-President, who
shall be elected by the elected Councillors from amongst themselves in the
special meeting convened under sub-section (2) of section 341B-1.

(2) The meeting to elect the Vice-President shall be presided over by the
Collector or such officer as the Collector may nominate specially in this behalf,
but the Collector or such other officer shall have no right to vote:

Provided that, notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or
the rules made thereunder, for regulating the procedure at meetings
(including the quorum thereat), the Collector or, as the case may be, the
officer, presiding over such meeting may, for sufficient reasons to be
recorded in writing, refuse to adjourn such meeting.

(3) If, in the election of the Vice-President, there is equality of votes, the
result of the election shall be decided by the officer presiding over such
meeting by drawing lots.

(4) The name of the Vice-President so elected shall be notified by the
Collector, in the Official Gazette, within fifteen days from such election.

(5) Any dispute regarding the election of the Vice-President shall be
referred to the State Government, whose decision thereon shall be final.

(6) Subject to the provisions of section 55A and other provisions of this
Act, the Vice-President, shall hold the office, for a term of two and half years
from the date of his election.

(7) If there is any vacancy in the office of the Vice-President for any reason
whatsoever, the vacancy shall be filled up by following the procedure
prescribed in sub-sections (1) to (3) and the Vice-President so elected shall
remain in office only for the remainder of the term, for which his predecessor
would have remained in office but for such vacancy.



HERTE I T SFETRT WA 316, FHART KR, 09/ R, Tk §3¢

341B-3. (1) The Collector shall, within seven days from the date of
election of the President, call a special meeting for the purpose of nominating
Councillors.

(2) The nominations of the Councillors under clause (b) of
sub-section (1) of section 9, shall be made in the prescribed manner.

(3) The meeting called under sub-section (1) shall be presided over by
the Collector or such officer as the Collector may by order in writing appoint
in this behalf. The Collector or such officer shall, when presiding over such
meeting, have the same powers as the President of a Nagar Panchayat when
presiding over a meeting of the Nagar Panchayat has, but shall not have the
right to vote :

Provided that, notwithstanding anything contained in this Act for
regulating the procedure at meetings (including the quorum required
thereat), the Collector or the officer presiding over such meeting may,
for reasons which in his opinion are sufficient, refuse to adjourn such
meeting.

341B-4. The term of office of the President, shall be of two and half
years.

341B-5. (1) A President of a Nagar Panchayat shall cease to be
the President if the Councillors by a resolution passed at a special meeting
by majority not less than three-fourths of the total number of Councillors
so decides :

Provided that, no such resolution shall be moved within a period of one
year from the date of the election of the President.

(2) The requisition for such special meeting shall be signed by not less
than one-half of the total number of Councillor’s and shall be sent to the
Collector.

(3) The Collector shall, within ten days of the receipt of a requisition
under sub-section (2), convene a special meeting of the Council :

Provided that, when the Collector convenes a special meeting, he shall
give intimation thereof to the President.

(4) A meeting to consider a resolution under sub-section (1) shall be
presided over by the Collector or any other officer authorised by him in this
behalf, but the Collector or such other officer shall have no right to vote.

(6) The nominated Councillors shall have no right to vote on any
resolution relating to the removal of the President.

(6) If the resolution seeking the removal of the President is not moved
or, as the case may be, rejected, in the special meeting convened for the purpose
under sub-section (3), no fresh resolution seeking the removal of the President
shall be brought before the Nagar Panchayat.

341B-6. (1) A Vice-President shall cease to be the Vice-President, if the
Nagar Panchayat by a resolution passed by a majority of not less than two-
thirds of the total number of the Councillors, at a special meeting, so decides :

Provided that, no such resolution shall be moved within a period of six
months from the date of election of the Vice-President.

9

Nomination of
Councillors of
Nagar
Panchayat.

Term of office of
President of
Nagar
Panchayat.

Removal of
President of
Nagar
Panchayats by
Councillors.

Removal of
Vice-President
of Nagar
Panchayats

by Councillors.



¢ HERT I T SFETRT WA 316, FHART QR, 09/ R, Tk §3¢

(2) The requisition for such special meeting shall be signed by not less
than one-half of the total number of Councillors and shall be sent to the
President, and the President shall, within ten days of the receipt of such
requisition, convene a special meeting of the Nagar Panchayat, where the
nominated Councillors shall have no right to vote.

(3) If the resolution seeking removal of the Vice-President is not moved
or as the case may be, rejected, in the special meeting convened for the
purpose under sub-section (2), no fresh resolution for such removal shall be
brought during the tenure of such Vice-President.”.

CHAPTER IV
MISCELLANEOUS

Power to 12. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
remove Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act or, as the case may be, the LIX of
difficulty. \faharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial 1949
Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, as Mah.
the occasion arises, by an Order published in the Official Gazette, give such XL of
directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the said Acts as amended 1965
by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the purpose
of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

Repeal of 13. (1) The Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Mah.
Mah. Ord. XVI Mynicipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Ord

of 20:fv?1111gd (Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2016, is hereby repealed. )2((\)]116 of

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporation Act and the Municipal LIX of
Councils Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been 1949.
done, taken or, as the case may be, issued under the corresponding provisions
of the said Acts, as amended by this Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBALI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

SHENUT HIT AT

ad 3, 3w ¢(¥)] TEAR, FHERT 2R, R0%9/GIT 7, 7k 233¢ [ g 3 fowa : T9& RW.00

AATARUT HHE
TTTerehel UhTIT

ERTE faurmesm Afufaw T TSauTel et Feet TRy T hod fatrew s
fafr 7 =ma frvree s fadad (FET FAE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. X of
2017) is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. X OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 12th January 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act.

WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra had promulgated the
Mah. Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment) Ordinance, 2016, on the
Ord XTI 16th June 2016;

0f 2016.
AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the
18th July 2016, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment) Bill,
2016 (L. A. Bill No. XXVII of 2016), for converting the said Ordinance into an
Act of the State Legislature, was passed by the Maharashtra Legislative
Assembly on the 20th July 2016, and was transmitted to the Maharashtra
Legislative Council,

®)

AT AB-—



2 HERTZ IMEA AT FATIRUT WRT TS, AHAGRT LR, 029/ R, Ik 233¢

AND WHEREAS thereafter, as the session of the Maharashtra
Legislative Council was prorogned on the 5th August 2016, the said Bill
could not be passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213 (2) (a) of the Constitution
of India, the said Ordinance shall cease to operate at the expiration of six
weeks from the date of re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after
the 28th August 2016 ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in
session; and the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances
existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action to
continue the operation of the provisions of the said Ordinance, for the Mah.
purposes hereinafter appearing; and, therefore, promulgated the Ord.
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment and Continuance) }2%]1%&
Ordinance, 2016 (hereinafter referred to as “the said Continuance ’

Ordinance”) on the 30%* August 2016;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Continuance
Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-Seventh year of the Republic of India as follows :-

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
commencement. (Amendement) Act, 2016.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 16th June 2016.

CHAPTER 11
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL
CORPORATIONS ACT

Amendment of 2. In section 5 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act LIX of
section 5 of (hereinafter, in this Act, referred to as “the Municipal Corporations Act”), 1949.
LIX0f1949. jn gub-section (2), in clause (a), in the Table,—

(a) in entry (iii), in column (2), for the words and figures “shall
not exceed 145.” the words and figures “shall not exceed 151.” shall be

substituted,;
(b) for entry (iv), the following entries shall be substituted,

namely :(—

“(tv) Above 24 lakhs and The minimum number of elected

upto 30 lakhs Councillors shall be 151.
For every additional population of
50,000 above 24 lakhs, one additional
Councillor shall be provided, so
however that the maximum number
of elected Councillors shall not exceed
161.

(v) Above 30 Lakhs The minimum number of elected

Councillors shall be 161.

For every additional population of
1 lakh above 30 lakhs, one additional
Councillor shall be provided, so



HERTZ IMEA AT FHTIRUT WA 1S, AHARI 2R, 029/ R, Ik £33¢ 3

however that the maximum number
of elected Councillors shall not exceed
175.”.

CHAPTER III
MISCELLANEOUS

3. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the Power to
Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by this Act, the State Government E?f?ovﬁ
may, as occasion arises, by an order published in the Official Gazette, give Hhewdty.
such directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the said Act, as
amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for
the purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (I) shall be laid, as soon as
may be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

1\633 4. (1) The Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment and 11\{/[%;?&(1)0(2

rd. . . . an. vurd.

XVIL of Continuance) Ordinance, 2016, is hereby repealed. XVIT of 2016
2016. (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken andsaving.

(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by the said
Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or, as the case may
be, issued under the corresponding provisions of the Municipal Corporations
Act, as amended by this Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBALI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

ad 3, 3w ¥3) WHAR, ¥ R}, R0%0/TD ¢, IH 83IR [ g% 2%, ffme : ¥0@ Rw.00

JTETERUT SHATH R0

TR AhTI
mERTE faarrize sfufam a weaueEt wenfua FAd Ry T Fod fatew enfor
fafa o = faurmEegs stEet fadad (FUSt FAE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax related Laws (Amendments,
Validation and Savings) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No.XLII of 2017), is hereby published under the

authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XLII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 29th May 2017).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations Act, the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles Tax Act, the Maharashtra
Village Panchayats Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, the Maharashtra State Tax
on Professions, Trades, Callings and Employments Act, 1975 and the
Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002.

III of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal

I f}lggg Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act, the
© LIX of Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles

1949. Tax Act, the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, the Maharashtra Municipal

L)g%gf Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, the
III of Maharashtra State Tax on Professions, Trades, Callings and Employments
1959. Act, 1975 and the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002, for the purposes

Mah. XL
of?l 1965.
Mah. XVI
of 1975.
Mah. IX

of 2005.

®)
I 3TE—R0—2



Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 3
of III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 126
of III of

1888.

Amendment
of section 128
of III of

1888.

Amendment of
section 139 of
IIT of 1888.

Deletion of
heading
above section
192 of III of
1888.

Deletion of
sections 192,
193, 194, 194-
1A, 194A, 195,

195-1A and
195-1B of III

of 1888.

Amendment
of section 196
of III of

1888.

Deletion of
section 199 of
IIT of 1888.

Deletion of
section 213 of
IIT of 1888.
Deletion of
sections 478,
478-1A, 478-
1AA and 478-1B
of IIT of 1888.
Deletion of
Schedules H
and H-1 of
III of 1888.

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, W 2R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk KR]3R

hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the
Republic of India as follows :(—
CHAPTER 1
1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax
related laws (Amendments, Validation and Savings) Act, 2017.
(2) (a) Section 63, sub-section (3) of section 67 and section 73 shall come
into force on the date of publication of this Act in the Official Gazette ;
() remaining sections shall come into force from such date as the
State Government may by notification in the Official Gazette appoint, and
different dates may be appointed for different provisions.

CHAPTER 1I
AMENDMENTS TO THE MUMBAI M UNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.

2. In section 3 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act (hereinafter,

in this Chapter, referred to as “the Mumbai Corporation Act”), clause (pa)
shall be deleted.

3. In section 126 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section (2), in

clause (a), the words “and, in the case of octroi on such articles” shall be
deleted.

4. In section 128 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section (1), in
clause (a), the words “and the articles on which octroi shall be levied,” shall
be deleted.

5. In section 139 of the Mumbai Corporation Act,
deleted.

entry (4) shall be

6. Above section 192 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the heading
“Octroi” shall be deleted.

7. Sections 192, 193, 194, 194-1A, 194A, 195, 195-1A and 195-1B of the
Mumbai Corporation Act shall be deleted.

8. Insection 196 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the words “or by adding
to the number of articles on which octroi is being levied” shall be deleted.

9. Section 199 of the Mumbai Corporation Act shall be deleted.

10. Section 213 of the Mumbai Corporation Act shall be deleted.

11. Sections 478, 478-1A, 478-1AA and 478-1B of the Mumbai
Corporation Act shall be deleted.

12. Schedules H and H-1 of the Mumbai Corporation Act shall be
deleted.

III of
1888.



Iof

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, H R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk R’IR

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA ENTERTAINMENTS DUTY ACT.

13. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act

1923. (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Entertainments Duty Act”),—

Mah. V
of 1962.

41 of
2006.

Mah.
XL of
1965.

Mah. V
of 1962.

41 of
2006.

IIT of
1888.

LIX of
1949.

(1) clause (d-1) shall be deleted ;
(2) after clause (f-al), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely :—
“(f-a2) “local authority” means,—

(i) a “Municipality” as defined in clause (e) of article 243P
of the Constitution ;

(11) a “Zilla Parishads” as constituted under the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961 ;

(i11) “Cantonment Board”, as defined in section 3 of the
Cantonments Act, 2006 ;

(f-a3) “Chief Officer” means a person appointed or deemed to
be appointed as Chief Officer under the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 ;

(f-a4) “Chief Executive Officer” of the Zilla Parishads
means the Chief Executive Officer of a Zilla Parishad appointed
under section 94 of Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 ;

(f~ab5) “Chief Executive Officer” of the Cantonment Board
means the person appointed as the Chief Executive Officer of a
cantonment under the Cantonments Act, 2006 ;

(f-a6) “Municipal Commissioner” means the Municipal
Commissioner for the Municipal Corporation appointed under the
Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act or as the case may be, under
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act ;”.

14. In section 3 of the Entertainments Duty Act,—

(1) except sub-sections (6), (7) and (8), for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall
be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (3), in clause (j), for the word “Commissioner”
the words “local authority” shall be substituted ;

(3) in sub-section (4), in clause (d), for the words “Collector of the
District” the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“(i) Municipal Commissioner, in case of a Municipal
Corporation, or

(iz) Chief Officer, in case of a Municipal Council, or

(i11) Chief Executive Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad or a
Cantonment Board, as the case may be,”;

(4) in sub-section (13), in clause (b), in sub-clause (i), for the word
“Collector” the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“(t) Municipal Commissioner, in case of a Municipal
Corporation
2

Amendment
of section 2
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 3
of T of 1923.



Deletion of
section 3AA
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 3A
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 4
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 4B
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 4E
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 5
of I of 1923.
Amendment
of section 6
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 8
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9A
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9B
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9C
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9D
of T of 1923.

Amendment
of section 10
of T of 1923.

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, W 2R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk KR]3R

(i1) Chief Officer, in case of a Municipal Council,

(ii1) Chief Executive Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad or a
Cantonment Board, as the case may be, ”.

15. Section 3AA of the Entertainments Duty Act shall be deleted.

16. In section 3A of the Entertainments Duty Act,—

(1) for the words “State Government” the words “local authority”
shall be substituted;

(2) the words, figure and letters “and a surcharge provided by
section 3AA” shall be deleted.

17. In section 4 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

18. In section 4B of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

19. In section 4E of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

20. In section 5 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word “Collector”
wherever it occurs, the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

21. In section 6 of the Entertainments Duty Act, in sub-sections (1)
and (2), for the word “Collector” the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

22. In section 8 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the portion
beginning with “The Commissioner” and ending with “the State Government”
the words “Any officer duly authorized by the local authority” shall be
substituted.

23. In section 9A of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

24. In section 9B of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word
“Government” the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

25. In section 9C of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word
“Collector” the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

26. In section 9D of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word
“Collector” the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

27. In section 10 of the Entertainments Duty Act,—

(1) the existing section 10 shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1)
thereof; and in sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, for the words “ State
Government” wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall
be substituted ;

(2) after sub-section (I) as so re-numbered, the following sub-
section shall be added, namely :(—



TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, H R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk R’IR

“2) For the purposes of sub-section (1) , the powers of the
local authority shall be exercised by (i) the Municipal
Commissioner, in case of a Municipal Corporation, (ii) the Chief
Officer, in case of a Municipal Council, (iii) the Chief Executive
Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad, (iv) the Chief Executive Officer,

in case of a Cantonment Board, in their respective jurisdiction.”.

28.
“Collector”, wherever it occurs, the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“(i) Municipal Commissioner, in case of a Municipal Corporation,

(1) Chief Officer, in case of a Municipal Council, (iii) Chief
Executive Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad, (iv) Chief Executive

Officer, in case of a Cantonment Board”.

29.
Government”, at both the places where they occur, the words “State
Government and local authority” shall be substituted.

30. Section 13 of the Entertainments Duty Act shall be deleted.

31. Schedule appended to the Entertainments Duty Act shall be deleted.

CHAPTER IV
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

LIX of 32. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act
1949. (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Municipal Corporations Act”),
clauses (6A), (31A), (42), (70A), (70B) and (70C) shall be deleted.

33. In section 32 of the Municipal Corporations Act,-

(1) in sub-section (4), the words “octroi or” shall be deleted,;
(2) in sub-section (5), the word “octroi” shall be deleted.

34. In section 99 of the Municipal Corporations Act, the words, brackets

and letters “excluding local body tax under clause (aaa) thereof” shall be

deleted.

35. Sections 99A, 99B, 99C and 99D of the Municipal Corporations Act

shall be deleted.

36. In section 127 of the Municipal Corporations Act, in sub-section
(2), clauses (a), (aa) and (aaa) shall be deleted.

37.
words “octroi and ” shall be deleted.

38. Section 146 alongwith the heading “Exemptions from Octroi” of the

Municipal Corporations Act shall be deleted.

39.
shall be deleted.

YT 3MS—R0—R

In section 10A of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word

In section 12 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State

In section 128 of the Municipal Corporations Act, in clause (5), the

In section 149 of the Municipal Corporations Act, sub-section (6)

Amendment
of section
10A of T of
1923.

Amendment
of section 12
of T of 1923.

Deletion of
section 13 of
I of 1923.

Deletion of
Schedule of 1
of 1923.

Amendment
of section 2
of LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 32
of LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 99
of LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
sections 99A
to 99D of
LIX of 1949.

Amendment
of section 127
of LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 128
of LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
section 146
of LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 149
of LIX of
1949.



Deletion of
Chapter XIA
and sections

152A to
1520 of LIX
of 1949.

Deletion of
Chapter XIB
and section
152P to 152T
of LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
sections 398
and 398-1A

of LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 466
of LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
Schedules A,
B and C of
LIX of 1949.

Amendment
of Schedule
D of LIX of

1949.

Amendment
in section 2
of LXV of
1958.

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, W 2R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk KR]3R

40. Chapter XIA and sections 152A to 1520 of the Municipal
Corporations Act shall be deleted.

41. Chapter XIB and sections 152P, 152Q, 152R, 152S and 152T of the
Municipal Corporations Act shall be deleted.

42. Sections 398 and 398-1A of the Municipal Corporations Act shall
be deleted.

43. In section 466 of the Municipal Corporations Act, in sub-section
(1), in para (A),—

(I) in clause (a), the words “octroi and ” shall be deleted,;
(2) in clause (b), the words “octroi and ” shall be deleted,;
(3) clause (c¢) shall be deleted;
(4) clause (e) shall be deleted;
(5) clause (g) shall be deleted.

44, Schedules A, B and C of the Municipal Corporations Act shall be
deleted.

45. In Schedule D of the Municipal Corporations Act, in Chapter VIII,
rules 26, 28 and 29 shall be deleted.

CHAPTER V

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MoTOR VEHICLES Tax AcT.

46. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles Tax Act, for clause
(1A), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1A) “cost of vehicle” in relation to,—

(a) a vehicle manufactured in India means, cost as per the
final cost mentioned in the purchase invoice of the vehicle issued
either by the manufacturer or the dealer of the vehicle which
shall include the basic manufacturing cost, Central Goods and
Services Tax levied under the Central Goods and Services Tax
Act, 2017, Integrated Goods and Services Tax under the Integrated
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017, Cess under the Goods and
Services Tax (Compensation to States) Act, 2017 and Goods and
Services Tax under the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act,
2017 and if the vehicle has been sold in the State of Maharashtra
from any other State or Union Territory shall include the Goods
and Services Tax paid in such State or Union Territory, and

LXV of
1958.

12 of
2017.
13 of
2017.

15 of
2017.

Mabh. of
2017.



52 of
1962.

13 of
2017.

15 of
2017.

12 of
2017.
13 of
2017.
15 of
2017.
Mah. ....

2017.
Mabh.
XLII

of
2017.

IIT of

47.

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, H R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk R’IR

(b) a vehicle imported into India irrespective of its place of
manufacture means cost as per the landed value of the vehicle
consisting of the assessable value under the Customs Act, 1962
and the customs duty paid thereupon, including additional duty
paid if any, as endorsed in the Bill of Entry by the Customs
Department, and Integrated Goods and Services Tax under the
Integrated Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017, and Cess under the
Goods and Services Tax (Compensation to States) Act, 2017, if
any.

Explanation.—(1) The discount given by the manufacturer or
the dealer, if any, shall be added in the final cost as mentioned in
the purchase invoice.

(2) The vehicles sold prior to the date of commencement of the
Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017, the Integrated Goods
and Services Tax Act, 2017, the Goods and Services Tax
(Compensation to States) Act, 2017 and the Maharashtra Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 and produced for registration after such date
shall be taxed as per the provisions which were in force prior to the
Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax related laws (Amendments,
Validation and Savings) Act, 2017;”.

CHAPTER VI
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VILLAGE PANCHAYATS ACT.

In section 3 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter,

1959. in this Chapter, referred to as “the Village Panchayats Act”), in section 3,
clauses (5), (11A) and (11B) shall be deleted.

48.

Section 124 A of the Village Panchayats Act shall be deleted.

CHAPTER VII

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND

Mah.

49.

InpusTRIAL TowNsHIPS AcT, 1965.

In section 2 of Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats

XL of gnd Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to
65. as “the Municipal Councils Act”), clause (3A) shall be deleted.

50.

In section 87A of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (3), in

clause (xi),—

(1) in sub-clause (a), the word “cess” shall be deleted;
(2) in sub-clause (b), the word “cess” shall be deleted.

51.

In section 105 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (1),

clauses (aa) and (e) shall be deleted.

52.

Chapter IXA and sections 148A to 1480 of the Municipal Councils

Act shall be deleted.

YT 3MS—Ro0—3

Amendment
of section 3
of III of
1959.

Deletion of
section 124A
of 1959.

Amendment
of section 2
of Mah. XL
of 1965.

Amendment
of section 87A
of Mah. XL
of 1965.

Amendment
of section 105
of Mah. XL
of 1965.

Deletion of
Chapter IXA
and sections
148A to
1480 of
Mah. XL of
1965.



¢ HERTE IMEA TSTUS AR WIT 1B, W R, R09/FS ¢, ITh RIR

CHAPTER VIII

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA STATE TAX ON PROFESSIONS,
TraDES, CALLINGS AND EMPLOYMENTS AcT, 1975.

Amendment 53. In Schedule I appended to the Maharashtra State Tax on Mah.
to Schedule I pyofegsions, Trades, Callings and Employments Act, 1975, for entry 20A, the XVI of

of M:fh 13(7\;1 following entry shall be substituted, namely :— 1975.
“20A. Persons, registered under the Maharashtra 2500 per Mah. ....
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017. annum.”. of 2017.
CHAPTER-IX
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VALUE ADDED
Tax Act, 2002.

Amendment 54. In the long title of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002 Mah.

in long title (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Value Added Tax Act”), the IX of
of Mah. 213(0‘; words “or purchase” shall be deleted. 2005.
Amendment 55. In the preamble of the Value Added Tax Act, the words “or
in preamble purchase” shall be deleted.
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment 56. In section 2 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
of section 2

of Mah. 21(§)(ng (1) clauses (1), (2) and (3-a) shall be deleted;
. (2) after clause (3-a) so deleted, the following clause shall be

inserted, namely :—

“(3-b) “appointed date for the Maharashtra Goods and Services Mah. ....
Tax Act” means the date on which the Maharashtra Goods and of 2017.

Services Tax Act, 2017 comes into force;”;

(3) in clause (4), in the Explanation, clause (i) shall be deleted,;

(4) clause (7) shall be deleted;

(5) in clause (8), Exception I, II and III shall be deleted,;

(6) clause (9) shall be deleted;

(7) for clause (12), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :—

“(12) “goods” means petroleum crude, high speed diesel, motor
spirit (commonly known as petrol), natural gas, aviation turbine
fuel and alcoholic liquor for human consumption;”;

(8) after clause (14) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(14A) “Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act” means the Mah. ...
Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017;; of 2017.

(9) clause (I17A) shall be deleted;
(10) in clause (20), Explanation IA shall be deleted;

(11) in clause (24), in the Explanation, in clause (b), in sub-clause
(vi), for the words and brackets “of goods, being food or any other article
for human consumption or any drink (whether or not intoxicating), the
words “of alcoholic liquor for human consumption” shall be substituted;

(12) in clause (25), Explanation IA shall be deleted;



AT HATE—R0—337

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, H R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk R’IR

(13) clause (27) shall be deleted;

(14) in clause (29), the words “or purchase tax leviable or as the
case may be,” shall be deleted;

(15) in clause (32), Explanation I shall be deleted;
(16) in clause (33), Explanation I shall be deleted.
In section 3 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) sub-section (I) shall be deleted;

(2) in sub-section (2),—

(a) for the words “to whom sub-section (1) does not apply and
whose turnover either of all sales or, as the case may be, purchases
made” the words “whose turnover of all sales of goods” shall be
substituted;

(b) in the proviso, the words “ and purchases” and the words

57.

“or turnover of purchases” shall be deleted,;

(8) in sub-section (3), the words “or turnover of purchases” shall

be deleted;

(4) sub-section (5A) shall be deleted;

(5) in sub-section (8), the words “or purchases” shall be deleted.
In section 6 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :(—

58.

“(1) There shall be levied a sales tax on the turnover of sales
of goods, specified in column (2) in SCHEDULE B at the rates set
out against each of them in column (3) of the said Schedule.”;

(2) in sub-section (2) , for the word and letter “ Schedule D”,
the word “ SCHEDULE B” shall be substituted,;

59. Sections 6A, 6B and 7 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

60. In section 8 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
(1) in sub-section (2), the words “and lubricants” shall be deleted,;
(2) sub-sections (3C) and (3D) shall be deleted.

61. In section 16 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (6), in clause (b), the words “or the turnover of
purchases” shall be deleted;

(2) after sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(6A) The registration of a dealer, who has not effected sale,
during the year 2016-17, of any goods, specified in column (2) in
SCHEDULE A or, as the case may be SCHEDULE B, as it exists
on the appointed date for the Maharashtra Goods and Services
Tax Act, shall be deemed to be cancelled with effect from the said
appointed date:

Provided that, any such dealer, whose registration is deemed
to be cancelled, may apply in the prescribed manner for the
revocation of the cancellation of his registration, if he intends to
carry on the business in these goods.”.

Amendment
of section 3
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 6
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Deletion of
sections 6A,
6B and 7 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 8
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 16
of Mah. IX of
2005.



20

Deletion of
section 17 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Insertion of
section 26B

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, W 2R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk KR]3R

62. Section 17 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

63. After section 26A of the Value Added Tax Act, the following section

in Mah. IX of shall be inserted, namely :—

2005.

Speedy
disposal of
various
proceedings.

Amendment

“26B. The State Government may enact a scheme by a notification
in the Official Gazette providing for,—

() the speedy disposal of proceedings of assessments under
section 23, rectifications under section 24, review under section
25, appeals under section 26, refund proceedings and recovery
proceedings;

(i1) criterion for selection of cases for assessment; and

(iti) criterion for selection of cases for withdrawal of pending
proceedings referred in clause (i).”.

64. In section 30 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (2), after

of section 30 the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

of Mah. IX of
2005.

Deletion of
section 31A
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 41
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Amendment
of section 42
of Mah. IX of

2005.

“Provided also that, in case a dealer, whose registration is deemed
to be cancelled under sub-section (6A) of section 16 , files an annual
revised return, as provided under clause () or, as the case may be,
clause (c¢), of sub-section (4) of section 20, for any period starting from
the 1st April 2017, then the interest shall be payable on the excess amount
of tax, payable as per such annual revised return from the prescribed
dates by the prescribed class of dealers.”.

65. Section 31A of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

66. In section 41 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (4),—

(1) in clause (a), the words “and petroleum products” shall be
deleted,;

(2) in clause (b), in the Explanation, the words “and petroleum
products” shall be deleted;

(3) clause (c¢) shall be deleted.
67. In section 42 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) sub-section (I) shall be deleted,;

(2) in sub-section (2), the portion beginning with the words “who
are running any eating house” and ending with the words “or vendors”
shall be deleted;

(3) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be added
and deemed to have been added with effect from the 1st April 2010,
namely :(—



68.

69.

70.

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, H R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk R’IR

“(3B) The registered dealers, who had undertaken the

construction of flats, dwellings or buildings or premises and
transferred them in pursuance of an agreement along with the
land or interest underlying the land and where,—

(a) such agreement is registered on or before the 31st
May 2017; and

(b) the works contract activity in respect of aforesaid
agreement is continued on or after the date notified for the
purpose of the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act or,
as the case may be, payment is received,

then notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section
(3A) or, as the case may be, in the Notification, Finance
Department, No. VAT/2015/CR-65/Taxation.-1 dated the 9th
July 2010, but subject to the conditions stated in column (3)
at Serial Number (3) to (5) and (7) of the aforesaid notification,
the said dealer shall,—

(i) determine the composition amount in lieu of tax
payable on the transfer of the goods (whether as goods or in
some other form), in execution of the works contract under
the Act, at one per cent. of the payment received in respect
of said flats, dwellings or buildings or premises till the date
immediately preceding the date on which the Maharashtra
Goods and Services Tax Act comes into force, and deduct the
amount so determined from the composition amount paid as
per the aforesaid notification, and

(ii) take the credit into the electronic credit ledger
prescribed under the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax
Act of the balance unutilized amount remained on the date
on which the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act comes
into force.” ;

(4) sub-sections (3), (3A) and (4) shall be deleted.
In section 45 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (2), the words “or purchased” shall be deleted;

2)

in sub-section (3),—
(a) the words “or purchases”, at both the places where they

occur, shall be deleted ;

(b) in the proviso, the words “ or purchase ” shall be deleted.

In section 47 of the Value Added Tax Act, after sub-section (2A),
the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“2B) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, if the
order of the Court, Tribunal or the Central Government is passed on
or after the appointed date of the Maharashtra Goods and Services
Tax Act, then the provisions of the said Act, in this regard, shall be
applicable.”.

In section 48 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (I), in clause (a),—

(a) sub-clauses (i), (iiz) and (iv) shall be deleted ;

(b) in sub-clause (ii), the words “or purchase” shall be deleted ;

(2) sub-section (3) shall be deleted.

R

Amendment
of section 45
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 47
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 48
of Mah. IX of
2005.



R

Deletion of
section 49 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 74
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Substitution
of section 84
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Declaration of
stock of goods
held on the
appointed
date and
calling for
other
information,
etc.

Deletion of
section 87 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
to Schedule A
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Deletion of
Schedules B,
C and E of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
to Schedule
D of Mah. IX
of 2005.

TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, W 2R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk KR]3R

71. Section 49 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

72. In section 74 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (3), clause
(c) shall be deleted.

73. For section 84 of the Value Added Tax Act, the following section
shall be substituted, namely :—

“84. (1) The Commissioner may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, require any class of registered dealers, as may be specified in
the notification, to declare the details, to the prescribed authority,
regarding capital assets and the stock of goods held by them on the
day immediately preceding the appointed date for the Maharashtra

Goods and Services Tax Act.

(2) The Commissioner may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
require any class of registered dealers, migrating to the Maharashtra
Goods and Services Tax Act to furnish any other information in the

prescribed manner.”.

74. Section 87 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

75. In Schedule A appended to the Value Added Tax Act, for the entries
1 to 63, the following entries shall be substituted, namely :(—

“l Toddy and Arak- Nil

2 Goods supplied from bond to foreign going ships

and aircrafts. Nil.”.

76. Schedules B, C, and E appended to the Value Added Tax Act shall
be deleted.

77. Schedule D appended to the Value Added Tax Act shall be renamed

as Schedule B thereof and in Schedule B as so renamed,—

(a) entry 4 shall be deleted ;

43

(b) in entry 6, in column (2), for the figures and words “ entry 8 of
SCHEDULE C, entry 11 and entry 11A ” the figures and words “ entry

11, 11A and entry 13 ” shall be substituted. ” ;



TERTE JMEA A TATIRUT 9T 316, H R, 0%9/TAS ¢, Wk R’IR

(c) for entries 12, 13 and 14 the following entries shall be substituted,

namely :(—

“12 Petroleum Crude 5%

13 Aviation Turbine Fuel sold to a Turbo-prop 5%

aircraft.

Explanation.—for the purposes of this entry,

“ Turbo-prop Aircraft ” means an aircraft deriving

thrust mainly from propeller, wich may be driven

by either turbine engine or piston engine.

14 Bunker Oil supplied to foreign going ships 6%

15 Natural Gas 13.5%.”.

CHAPTER X
VALIDATION AND SAVINGS.
IIT of 78. (1) Notwithstanding the amendments made in the Mumbai Savings.

18182 Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act, the

1923. Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles
LIX of Tax Act, the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
L)I(%‘Lgf Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, the
1958. Maharashtra State Tax on Professions, Trades, Callings and Employments
T of Act, 1975 and the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002 by this Act, those
lMah: laws and all rules, regulations, orders, notifications, form, certificates and
XL of notices, appointments and delegation of powers issued under those laws which
113[?}51 are in force immediately before the appointed day of the Maharashtra Goods
xXVI of and Services Tax Act, 2017 shall, subject to the other provisions of this Act,
1975. in so far as they apply, continue to have effect after the appointed day of the
lgga;dol? Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 for the purposes of the levy,
returns, assessment, re-assessment, appeal, determination, revision,

Mah. .... . . e e . . . .
of 2017 rectification, reference, limitation, production and inspection of accounts and
Mah documents and search of premises, transfer of proceedings, payment and
of 2017. recovery, calculation of cumulative quantum of benefits, exemption from
payment of tax and deferment of due date for payment of tax, cancellation of

the certificate of Entitlement, collection or deduction of tax at source, refund

or set off of any tax, withholding of any refund, exemption from payment of

tax, collection of statistics, the power to make rules, the imposition of any
penalty, or of interest or forfeiture of sum where such levy, returns
assessment, re-assessment, appeal, determination, revision, rectification,
reference, limitation, payment and recovery, calculation of cumulative
quantum of benefits, exemption from payment of tax and deferment of due

date for payment of tax, cancellation of the certificate of entitlement,
collection, deduction of tax at source, refund, set-off, withholding of any
refund, exemption, collection of statistics, the power to make rules, limitation,
production and inspection of accounts and documents and search of premises,
transfer of proceedings, penalty, interest or forfeiture of any sum relates to

Mah. ... any period ending before the appointed day of the Maharashtra Goods and
of 2017. Services Tax Act, 2017 or for any other purpose whatsoever connected with
or incidental to any of the purposes aforesaid and whether or not the tax,
penalty, interest, sum forfeited or tax deducted at source, if any, in relation

to such proceedings is paid before or after the appointed day of the

Mfago o Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017.
[0) .

g3



¥ HERTE IMEA TSTUS AR WIT 1B, W R, R09/FS ¢, ITh RIR

(2) Without prejudice to the provisions contained in the foregoing sub- I of
section, the provisions of section 7 of the Maharashtra General Clauses Act, 1904.
shall apply in relation to the repeal of any of the provisions of the Acts referred
to in sub-section (1).

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL



aw 3, IF |9) AR, WA ¢, R0R9/HIT o, I §RIR [gs ¥, fewa : T0d R9.00

SATARUT HHTHR 3R

U d UehTIT
R faurmesm sfuftaw T T Tenfua Feer Ry T hoa fafrem snfor
fafr @ = faurmees el fadad (FUst FEE).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
following translation in English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation and

the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act
No. LI of 2017), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

N. J. JAMADAR,

Principal Secretary and R. L. A. to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LI OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 1st September 2017).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act
and the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act.

Orlc\illai}lli WHEREAS the (;}overnor of Maharashtra had promu}ga‘ced the Mumbai

f2(;17 Municipal Corporation and the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations

0 * (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as “the said Ordinance”),
on the 8th January 2017 ;



AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213(2)(a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Ordinance had ceased to operate at the expiration of six weeks
from the date of re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after the 16th
April 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it was considered expedient to continue the operation
of the provisions of the said Ordinance and, therefore, the Governor of
Maharashtra has promulgated the Mumbai Municipal Corporation and the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment and Continuance)
Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as “the said Continuance Ordinance”),
on the 6th May 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra has, in exercise of the
powers conferred by clause (1) of article 174 of the Constitution of India and
in supersession of His Order dated the 25th April 2017, summoned the session
of both Houses of the Maharashtra State Legislature on the 20th May 2017,
only for the purpose of passing of the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax
Bill and other incidental Bills relating thereto and as such the said Bill could
not be taken for consideration by the Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213(2) (a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Continuance Ordinance ceased to operate at the expiration of
six weeks from the re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after the
30th June 2017;

AND WHEREAS it was considered expedient to continue the operation
of the provisions of the said Continuance Ordinance ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action to continue the operation of the provisions of the said Continuance
Ordinance, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore,
promulgated the Mumbai Municipal Corporation and the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations (Amendment and Second Continuance) Ordinance,
2017 (hereinafter referred to as “the said Second Continuance Ordinance”), on
the 14th July 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Second Continuance
Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-eighth year of the Republic of India as follows :(—

Mabh.
Ord.
VII of
2017.

Mah.
Ord.
XIII of
2017.



IIT of
1888.

LIX of
1949.

IIT of
1888.
LIX of
1949.

Mabh.
Ord.
XIII of

2017.
IIT of

1888.
LIX of
1949.

2. In section 152A of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in
sub-section (1), for the words “ shall be liable to pay every year a penalty,
which shall be equal to twice the property tax leviable on such building”, the
following shall be substituted, namely :—

“ shall be liable to pay a penalty, at such rate as may be decided by
the corporation, on such building”.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE M AHARASHTRA
MunicipAL CORPORATIONS ACT

3. In section 267A of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
sub-section (1), for the words “ shall be liable to pay every year a penalty,
which shall be equal to twice the property tax leviable on such building”, the
following shall be substituted, namely :—

“shall be liable to pay a penalty, at such rate as may be decided by
the corporation, on such building”.

CHAPTER IV
MISCELLANEOUS

4. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by this Act, the State Government
may, as occasion arises, by an order published in the Official Gazette, give
such directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the relevant Act, as
amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the
purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after expiry of a period of
two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order issued under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is issued, before each House of the State Legislature.

5. (I) The Mumbai Municipal Corporation and the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations (Amendment and Second Continuance) Ordinance,
2017, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act and the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the relevant Act, as amended by this Act.

Amendment
of section
152A of ITI of
1888.

Amendment
of section
267A of LIX
0f 1949.

Power to
remove
difficulty.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.
XIII of 2017
and saving.



ambeadie ol

Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amenament) Ordinance, 2017, shall
with effect from 8th January 2017, being the date of commencement of the (.4 111
said Ordinance, continue to be in force and be deemed to be continuously in of2017.
force.



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

g 3, I’F §9(R)] THAR, EaT ¢, R0%9/HTE R0, Tk §’3R [ U= 3, ffwa : ¥ Rw.00

STHTEATUT SHHTh 33

TR IehTITT

meRTe faurrzs afufem o ToauEt aEfue Felet SreERY T Fetet fafraw enfur
fafer @ = fawrmega et fadad (St IETe).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations

and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No. LII of 2017), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

N. J. JAMADAR,

Principal Secretary and R.L.A. to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LII OF 2017

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 1st September 2017).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra had promulgated the Mumbai
Mah. Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the
Ord. VI Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial

of 2017. Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as “ the
said Ordinance”), on the 2nd February 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the
6th March 2017, the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Bill, 2017 (L.A. Bill No.
IV of 2017), for converting the said Ordinance into an Act of the State
Legislature was passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly on the 16th
March 2017 and was transmitted to the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

®
AT 3ME—233-2



R HERTE ITE TSI SFETTRUT WIT 316, TR ?, R0%9/HIE 0, Ik 833%

AND WHEREAS thereafter, as the session of the Maharashtra
Legislative Council was prorogued on the 7th April 2017, the said Bill could
not be passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213 (2)(a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Ordinance had ceased to operate at the expiration of six weeks
from the date of re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after the 16th
April 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it was considered expedient to continue the operation
of the provisions of the said Ordinance ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in
session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action to continue the operation of the provisions of the said Ordinance, for
the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, the Governor of
Maharashtra has promulgated the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment and
Continuance) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as “ the said
Continuance Ordinance”), on the 30th May 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Continuance
Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows :(—

CHAPTER 1

PRELIMINARY.
Short title 1. (1) This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
comm elflgf_l Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,

ment. Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2017.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 2nd February 2017.

CHAPTER II
AMENDMENT TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.
Amendment 2. Insection 16 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in sub-section
of Sec&(}rﬁlo? (1), in clause (h), after the words “ a certificate of Assistant Commissioner ”

1888. the words “ or a self-certificate by such person ” shall be inserted.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL, CORPORATIONS ACT.
Amendment 3. In section 10 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
of S%Cfti%(loof sub-section (1), in clause (%), after the words “ a certificate of the Ward Officer
1949. of the concerned corporation ” the words “ or a self-certificate by such person ”

shall be inserted.

CHAPTER IV
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,
INAGAR PANCHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL TowNsHIPS AcT, 1965.
Amendment 4. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Of;ﬁ‘i\iﬁﬁ%ﬁ Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1), in clause
0of1965. (m), after the words “ a certificate of the Authorised Officer of the concerned

Council ” the words “ or a self-certificate by such person ” shall be inserted.

Mabh. Ord.
VIII of
2017.

III of
1888.

LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.



TERT JITEA TSI FHIERUT 9T 313, AT ?, 0%9/HE R0, Ik §]3R 3

CHAPTER V
MISCELLANEOUS
Mah, 5. (I) The Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Repeal of
Ord. . . . . Mah. Ord.
VI of Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats iyt o£9017
2017. and Industrial Townships (Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2017, and saving.
is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken

(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding

III of provisions of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra
1888. Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Iilg)igf Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 as amended by the
Mah. X, said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or, as the case may
of 1965. be, issued under the corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts, as

amended by this Act.

6. For the removal of doubt, it is hereby declared that all the provisions Removal of
111 of of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal doubt.

1888. Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Iilg)igf Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, as amended by the Mumbai
Mah. x1, Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the
of 1965. Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Mah. Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, shall with effect from 2nd February

Ord. VI 2017, being the date of commencement of the said Ordinance, continue to be

of 2017.
in force and be deemed to be continuously in force.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBALI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



HERTE IMEA TS
HAHATGWUT HIIT AT

ad 3, 3@ se(3)] TFRAR, SR 2, R0%9/WTE R0, W 83 [79 3, fFma : @@ RW.00

STHTIRUT hHTh I¥

U d UehTIT
R faurmesm sfuftaw T T Tenfua Feer Ry T hoa fafem snfor
fafr @ = faurmees el fadad (Fust FEE).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
following translation in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations

(Amendment) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No. LIII of 2017), is hereby published under
the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

N. J. JAMADAR,

Principal Secretary and R. L. A. to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LIII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 1st September 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

LIX of AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
1949. circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
Mah. action further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, for

0?21"6115( the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the
" Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, on the
13th June 2017 ;



dU“U“‘ bt 4. 4/ 1115 ACL lllay DC Callcl UullC lviallalasiitla fviullliCipal Lol polatlOlls
and commen-
(Amendment) Act, 2017.

cement.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 13th June 2017.
CHAPTER 11

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT

Amendment 2. In section 79 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in 11X of
of s%(%t}_?l&lgf clause (g),— 1949.
1949. (a) for the portion beginning with the words “notwithstanding

anything contained in this section,” and ending with the words “specially
in any particular case of such land:”, the following portion shall be
substituted, namely :(—

“notwithstanding anything contained in this section, the
Commissioner may, with the sanction of the Corporation and with
the approval of the State Government grant a lease, for a period
not exceeding thirty years, of a land belonging to the Corporation,

(i) which is declared as a slum area under the provisions
of the Maharashtra Slum Areas (Improvement, Clearance and Mah.
Redevelopment) Act, 1971, to a co-operative society of eligible XXVIII
slum dwellers; or as the case may be, to the eligible slum dweller of 1971.
individually, at a premium to be decided by the State
Government and subject to the prescribed terms and conditions;
or

(ii) to persons who are dishoused as a result of the
implementation of any Development Scheme of the Corporation
or to the Co-operative Housing Society formed exclusively by
persons who are dishoused as a result of the implementation
of any Development Scheme of the Corporation; or

(iti) to any Department or undertaking of the Government
of Maharashtra or of the Government of India, for the public
purposes; or

(iv) to a public trust, society or company registered
exclusively for medical and educational purposes, under the
Maharashtra Public Trusts Act, or the Societies Registration 1950
Act, 1860, or the Maharashtra Co-operative Societies Act, 1960, '

. XXT of
or the Companies Act, 2013, as the case may be; or 1860,
Mah.

XXIV of
1961.

18 of
2013.

(v) to a public trust registered under the Maharashtra XXIXof
Piuiblic Truste Act or a cocietv recictered inder the Societiee 1950.

XXIX of



The approval of the State Government under this clause may
be given either generally for any class of cases of such lands or
specially in any particular case of such land :”;

(b) for the existing FExplanation, the following Explanation
shall be substituted, namely :(—

Mah. “Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause, “eligible slum
5?1(;771? dweller” means the eligible slum dweller as defined in clause (c-b)
(0) .

of section 2 of the Maharashtra Slum Areas (Improvement,
Clearance and Redevelopment) Act, 1971.”.

CHAPTER III
MISCELLANEOUS

3. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
LIX of Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by this Act, the State
1949. Government may, by an order published in the Official Gazette, give such
directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the said Act, as amended
by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the purpose

of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (7) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

Mah. 4. (1) The Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment)
Or(;(ﬁgf Ordinance, 2017, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
LIXof provisions of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by
1949. the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as
the case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the said Act, as
amended by this Act.

Power to
remove
difficulty.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. X
0of 2017 and
saving.



RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

g ¥, Iw (9)] WHAR, FHART 4, R0¢/WW W, Th 23R [q= 3, fome : 0@ R9.00

STETARUT HhHATH 9
T e UhTeT
R faurmes™ afufem @ TeauTert TEu e Ry a heret fafraw smfor
fafe @ =m frarmegs el fadas (Fush sHaE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Second Amendment) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act.
No. VII of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VII OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 15th January 2018).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circum-

stances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action

LIX of further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, for the

1949. purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the

Mah. Ord. Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2017,
XXIIof ) the 12th October 2017 ;

2017.
AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act
of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the
Republic of India as follows :(—

AT 3B—9-2 (?)



Short title
and
commence-
ment.

Amendment
of section
149A of LIX of
1949.

Validation of
duty levied
and collected.

HERTE IMEF AT FHTERUT HRT 1S, AHTRT 4, 084/ R4, Ik §]3IR

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
(Second Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 12th October 2017.

CHAPTER 1I
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

2. In section 149A of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act,—

(i) for sub-sections (I) and (2), the following sub-sections shall be
substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect
from the 1st July 2017, namely :—

“(1) The stamp duty leviable under the Maharashtra Stamp Act,
on instruments of sale, gift and usufructuary mortgage, respectively,
of immovable property shall, in the case of any such instrument
relating to immovable property situated in the City, shall be
increased by a surcharge at the rate of one per cent., in the case of
sale or gift, on the value of the property so situated and in the case
of an instrument of usufructuary mortgage on the amount secured
by the instrument as set forth in the instrument and shall be
collected accordingly under the said Act.

(2) For the purposes of this section, section 28 of the
Maharashtra Stamp Act, shall be read and enforced as if specifically
required the particulars therein referred to be set forth separately
in respect of,—

(a) the property situated in the City ; and

(b) the property situated in any other area,” ;

(i1) in sub-section (3), for the words “each of the notified City” the
words “of the City” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from the 1st July 2017 ;

(ii1) in sub-section (5), the following shall be added at the end,
namely :(—

“For the purposes of this section, the State Government may
make rules retrospectively with effect from the 1st July 2017.”.

CHAPTER III
MISCELLANEOUS

3. (I) Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgement, decree
or order of any court to the contrary, any assessment, review, levy or collection
of stamp duty or surcharge in respect of execution of instruments of sale,
gift and usufructuary mortgage, or any action taken or thing done in relation
to such assessment, review, levy or collection under the provisions of the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act (hereinafter in this section referred
to as “the Municipal Corporations Act”) prior to the date of commencement
of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Second Amendment) Act, 2017
(hereinafter in this section referred to as “the Amendment Act”), shall be
deemed to be valid and effective as if such assessment, review, levy or
collection or action or thing had been duly made, taken or done under the

LIX of
1949.

LX of
1958.

LX of
1958.

LIX of
1949.

Mah.
VII of
2018.



HERTE IMEF AT FHTERUT HRT 1S, AHGRT 4, 084/ Ry, Ik §]3IR 3

Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by the Amendment Act, and
accordingly,—

(a) all acts, proceedings or things done or taken by any authority
or by the State Government or by any officer of the State Government in
connection with the assessment, review, levy or collection or action or
thing in connection with the levy of such stamp duty or surcharge , for
all purposes be deemed to be, and to have always been done or taken in
accordance with the law;

(b) no suit, appeal, application or other proceedings shall lie or be
maintained or continued in any Court or before any Tribunal, officer or
other authority for the refund of such stamp duty or surcharge so paid;
and

(¢) no Court, Tribunal, officer or other authority shall enforce any
decree or order directing the refund of such duty or surcharge.

(2) For the removal of doubt it is hereby declared that, nothing in sub-
section (1) shall be construed as preventing a person,—

(a) from questioning in accordance with the provisions of the
Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by the Amendment Act,
assessment, review, levy or collection of such stamp duty or surcharge,
referred to in sub-section (1), or

(b) from claiming refund or any stamp duty or surcharge paid by
him in excess of the amount due from him by way of stamp duty under
the Municipal Corporations Act as amended by the Amendment Act.

(3) Nothing in the Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by the
Amendment Act, shall render any person liable to be convicted of any offence
in respect of anything done or omitted to be done by him, before the date of
commencement of the Amendment Act, if such act or omission was not an
offence under the Municipal Corporations Act on the relevant date, but for
such amendment made by the Amendment Act; nor shall any person in respect
of such act or omission be subject to a penalty greater than that which could
have been imposed on him under the law in force immediately before the
date of commencement of the Amendment Act.

4. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the Powerto
LIXof Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, as amended by this Act, the State remove
1949. Government may, as the occasion arises, by an Order published in the Official difficulty.
Gazette, give such directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the said
Act as amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient
for the purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (7) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

Mah. 5. (1) The Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Second Amendment) Repeal of
Ord. - Ordinance, 2017, is hereby repealed. Mah. Ord.
XXIII of ' _ _ _ XXIII of 2017
2017. (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken .4 saving.

(including any notification or order issued) under the Maharashtra Municipal
LIXof Corporations Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to
1949. have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding
provisions of the said Act, as amended by this Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBALI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

aw ¥, 3 1] WIZAR, HIE R0, R0%¢ /WA R, ek 23R [ U= ¥, fFwe @ ¥ Q.00

ST THHTH 3%
TTTehe AT

R faurmesm Afuftaw T TSauTel et Feet ARy T hod fatrew s
fafer 7 =ma favrmega eetet fadas (FUst IATE).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and

the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. XXI of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXI OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 20th March 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal

III of Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the

LIl)isif Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
1949 Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby

Mah. XL enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—
of 1965.

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

1. This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Short title.
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2018.

9T 3BS-38—2 *®)



Amendment
of section 5B
of III of

HERTZ IMEA U SAWIERVT WAT 316, WTE R0, 0%¢/HIETT IR, I 2’3

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MUMBAT MUNICIPAL, CORPORATION ACT.
2. In section 5B of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act (hereinafter

referred to as “the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act”), for the first proviso,

1888. the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

Amendment
of section 37
of III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 5B
of LIX of

“Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing on the
date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, in accordance with the
election programme declared by the State Election Commission, a person
who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers but
who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny

Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any other proof

of having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee; and

(i1) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee :”.

3. Insection 37 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in sub-section

(2A), for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the office of the Mayor for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing
on the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation,
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, a person who has applied to
the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his Caste Certificate before
the date of filing the nomination papers but who has not received the
validity certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall
submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee; and

(1) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee:”.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.
4. In section 5B of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act

(hereinafter referred to as “ the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act”),

1949 for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing on the
date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal

IIT of
1888.

Mah.
XX1
of 2018.

Mah.
XX1
of 2018.

LIX of
1949.

Mah. XXI
of 2018.



HERTE IS T SHTIRUT 9T 308, AT R0, R0%¢/WITA R, Wk []3R 3

Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, in accordance with the
election programme declared by the State Election Commission, a person
who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers but
who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—
(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and
(i1) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee : ”.
5. In section 19 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in Amendment

of section 19

. of LIX of
substituted, namely :— 1949.

“Provided that, for the elections for the office of the Mayor for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing

sub-section (IB), for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be

on the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation,

Mah. the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
XXT

of 2018 Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)

Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, a person who has applied to
the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his Caste Certificate before
the date of filing the nomination papers but who has not received the
validity certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall
submit, alongwith the nomination papers,-

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee; and

(i1) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee:”.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, INAGAR PANCHAYATS AND
InpUSTRIAL TownNsHIPS AcT, 1965.

Mah. 6. In section 9A of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Amendment

XL of of section 9A

1965. of Mah. XL of
to as “ the Municipal Councils Act ”), for the first proviso, the following proviso 1965.

Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred

shall be substituted, namely :(—
“Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
Mah. date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing on the
of 2018. date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the



¥ HERTZ IMEA U SAWIERVT WAT 316, WTE R0, 0%¢/HIETT IR, I 2’3

Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, in accordance with the
election programme declared by the State Election Commission, a person
who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers but
who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(i1) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee : ”.

Amendment 7. In section 51-1B of the Municipal Councils Act, for the first proviso,

Ogls_el‘;;i";; the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—
Mah. )1%6? “Provided that, for the elections for the office of the President for

which the last date of filing of nomination falls during the period
commencing on the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Mah.
Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the XXI
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial of 2018.
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, a

person who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification

of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers

but who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of

the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny
Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any other proof
of having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee; and

(i1) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee :”.

Amefndnfc?nt 8. In section 341B of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (4),—
0l section

341B of (a) after the word and figure “ section 9 ” the figure and letter
Mah. )1%‘6? “, 9A ” shall be inserted ;

(b) for the word, figures and letter “ section 51-1A ” the words, figures
and letters “ sections 51-1A and 51-1B ” shall be substituted.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBALI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

ad ¥, 3w &2()] THAR, AR R0, R0%¢/HMEUT R, ¥ LR¥0 [ g% 3, fwa : 3@ Rw9.00

STHTERUT SHHTH 2R

TTErghe WehTIT
R faurmee™ afufem @ TeauTet TEue e ARy a hetet fafraw smfor
fafer @ =ma fasmmega eetet fadas (FUst IETE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LIII
of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LIII OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 10th August 2018).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act,
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial

Townships Act, 1965.
ITI of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
L11§(8(8)f Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the

1949. Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial

)lzllLaEf Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby

1965. enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

T 3AB-2R9-R



R HERTZ IMEA AU SAWERUT AT A6, AR o, 0%¢/SMAUT 2R, Ik R]¥0

CHAPTER 1

PRELIMINARY
Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Act, 2018.

CHAPTER II
AMENDMENT TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.
Amendment 2. In section 152A of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in
1§2f ffg?fﬁ sub-section (1), after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be added,

0f 1888. namely :—

“ Provided further that, the rates decided by the Corporation under
this sub-section shall be deemed to have came into effect from the 1st
April 2010, being the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation (Third Amendment) Act, 2006. .

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

Amendment 3. Insection 267A of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, after
26%5&55%3%?)% the first proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—
0f 1949.

“ Provided further that, the rates decided by the Corporation under
this sub-section shall be deemed to have came into effect from the
4th January 2008, being the date of commencement of the Bombay
Provincial Municipal Corporations, the City of Nagpur Corporation and
the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Indusrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2007. ”.

CHAPTER IV
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,
NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL TowNsHIPS AcT, 1965.

Amendment 4. In section 189A of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

189%5?1(\3/};% Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1),—

XL of 1965. (a) for the words “ shall be liable to pay every year a penalty, which
shall be equal to twice the property tax leviable on such building ”, the

following shall be substituted, namely :—

“shall be liable to a penalty, at such rate as may be decided, from
time to time, by the Government, by an order, on such building ”;

(b) after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :(—

“Provided further that, the rates decided by the Government
under this sub-section, in view of the amendment carried out by clause
(a) of section 4 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Act, 2018,
shall be deemed to have came into effect from the 4th January 2008,
being the date of commencement of the Bombay Provincial Municipal
Corporations, the City of Nagpur Corporation and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Indusrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2007.”.

IIT of
1888.

Mah. XI
of 2009.

LIX of
1949.

Mah. II
of 2008.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah.
LIII of
2018.
Mah. II
of 2008.



HERT IMEA SIS SAWERVT WET 36, AR 0, 0¢4/SMEUT R, IF LR¥o 3

CHAPTER V
MISCELLANEOUS
5. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the Powerto
Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations .S '
IIT of L i difficulty.
1888. Act or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
LIXof Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Act, the
" State Government may, as occasion arises, by an order published in the Official
Mah. XL . . . . . . . .
of 1965. Gazette, give such directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the
relevant Act, as amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or
expedient for the purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order issued under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as
may be, after it is issued, before each House of the State Legislature.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY 1/C DIRECTOR
SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI
ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

g ¥, 3F cu(R)] AR, feHaR 2%, Ro/¢/ITETAW 3, Wk R¥o [ TP &, fFEA ¢ T RW.00

STHTIRUT SHHTH LES

TR TehTIT

MRt fauarrees sfufraw g Toauent et Fed IRy g oot fafaw st
fafr @ =ma favrmega et fadad (FUSt aE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (third Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LXV
of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LXV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 14th December 2018).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances

nof existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action further to
1888. amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Iigi,gf Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Mah. XL Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and,
of 1965. therefore, promulgated the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Mah. Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and

Ord. XX Industrial Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, on the 27th September 2018 ;
of 2018.
Q)

AT 3AS-/E—



Short title and

HERTE JEA AU SAHTRUT 9T 318, feHaw ¥, 0%¢/AUETAUT R3, IF R¥o

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the

State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

CHAPTER |
PRELIMINARY.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the

commence- Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
ment. panchayats and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018.

Amendment of

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 27th September 2018.

CHAPTER I
AMENDMENTS TO THE MumMBAl MuniciPAL CORPORATION ACT.

2. In section 5B of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act (hereinafter in this

section 5B of Chapter referred to as “Mumbai Corporation Act”),—

Il of 1888.

Amendment of
section 37 of
111 of 1888.

Amendment of

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been

substituted as “twelve months”.”.

3. Insection 37 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section (2A),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been

substituted as “twelve months”.”.

CHAPTER 1l
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MuniciPAL CORPORATIONS AcCT.

4. In section 5B of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act (hereinafter

section 5B of n this Chapter referred to as “Maharashtra Corporations Act”),—

LIX of 1949.

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from the 7th April 2015 ;

I of
1888.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Mah.
LXVof
2018.

LIX of
1949.



HERTE JEA AU SAHTRUT 9T 318, feHaw ¥, 0%¢/AUETAUT R3, IF R¥o

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of

Mah. the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
LXV of Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
2018. and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six

months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

5. In section 19 of the Maharashtra Corporations Act, in sub-section (1B),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of

Mah. the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
LXV of Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
2018. and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six

months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNIcIPAL CouNciLs, NAGAR PANCHAYATS
AND INDUSTRIAL TowNsHIPS AcT, 1965.

Mah. XL 6. In section 9A of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
of 1965. and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as
“Municipal Councils Act”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) afterthe second proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of

Mah. the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
LXV of Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
2018.

and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been

substituted as “twelve months”.”.

HIT 3MS-2_E&—R

Amendment of
section 19 of
LIX of 1949.

Amendment of
section 9A of
Mah. XL of
1965.



4

Amendment of
section 51-1B
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Saving as to
certain
elections.

Saving as to
certain
disqualification.

Power to
remove
difficulty.

HERTE JEA AU SAHTRUT 9T 318, feHaw ¥, 0%¢/AUETAUT R3, IF R¥o

7. In section 51-1B of the Municipal Councils Act,—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

CHAPTER V
MISCELLANEOUS

8. Nothing in this Act shall affect the elections conducted by the State Election
Commission for conducting the elections or any programme declared by it therefor,
prior to the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, for filling up
the resultant vacancy in view of the provisions of section 5B or sub-section (2A) of
section 37 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, section 5B or
sub-section (1B) of section 19 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act,
section 9A or section 51-1B of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act,1965, as it stood prior to such date of
commencement.

9. Any person, who has obtained the Caste Certificate and validity certificate
but has not filed such certificate prior to the date of commencement of this Act, shall
not be deemed to be disqualified under the provisions of the relevant Municipal law,
if he submits such certificate within a period of fifteen days from the date of
commencement of this Act :

Provided that, the provisions of this section shall not apply where the State
Election Commission has already prior to the date of commencement of this Act
held elections to fill the vacancy of such person or declared the programme for
holding of such election.

10. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the Mumbai
Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act or, as the
case may be, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, as the
occasion arises, by an Order published in the Official Gazette, give such directions
not inconsistent with the provisions of the said Acts as amended by this Act, as
may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the purpose of removing the
difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period of two
years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may be,
after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Il of
1888.
LIX of
1949.
Mah. XL
of 1965.

Il of
1888.
LIX of
1949.
Mah. XL
of 1965.



HERTZ I W0 AERUT 91T A6, fSHaw ¥, 0%¢/ITETET {3, T R¥o Y

Mah. 11. (1) The Mumbai Municial Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Repeal of
Ord. XX Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and 'V;azhdgd-ﬁx
0f 2018. |ndustrial Townships (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, is hereby repealed. gaving. an

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken (including

llof any notification or order issued) under the corresponding provisions of the Mumbai
1888. Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Iilgﬁgf Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act,
Mah. xL. 1965, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done,
of 1965. taken or issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the

said Acts, as amended by this Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY 1/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR
SHRIMANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

HERT I AU
HAHTYWUT HIIT AT

g ¥, 3iF ) AR, fedar u, 0%¢/FUEE Y, WH R¥o [ g5 2, ffwer : F0@ R9.00

STHTRUT SHHTh 9%

PIRER R CaNE

R faurmesm Afufaw T TSauTel et Feet TRy T hod fatraw s
fafr 7 =ma frvree s fadad (FEt wAE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Second Amendment) Act, 2018. (Maharashtra Act No. LXX of
2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LXX OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 15th December 2018).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act.

LIX of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra
1949. Municipal Corporations Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is
hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :(—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Short title.
(Second Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2)
AT STE—R0%-2



R HERTE IAMHET ASTUA THTARUT HIAT ATS, fedaR Qu, R0%¢/3TUTTATT R, Wk LR¥o0

Amendment 2. In section 73 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in LIX of
of Sicftﬁ&?% clause (c), for the words “Subject to the above, for any contract which involves 1949.
1949. an expenditure in excess of rupees twenty-five lakhs, the previous approval
of the Standing Committee shall be necessary:” the words “Subject to the
above, for any contract which involves an expenditure in excess of the amount
as specified by the State Government, by notification in the Official Gazette,
from time to time, the previous approval of the Standing Committee shall be
necessary and different amount may be specified in respect of different classes

of Corporations:”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRIMANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR
SHRIMANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

SAYTERUT {HIIT ATS

g ¥, IAH C9(W)] AR, feHaw o, RoR¢/JAUTET 3%, IF R¥o [T R, fFwa : vud Rw.00

AETIRUT SHHTH R8¢

TTTerhe ThTI
R Rurriser ftffam 7 et Renfia dae sreaRee 9 Foa fafe snfor
fafr g =g Rurmega seelt AIggd (ST IrgaR).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LXXV of 2018) is hereby published under
the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. LXXV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “Maharashtra
Government Gazette”, on the 17th December 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
Act,1965.

LIX of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal

%}949- Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
';Afaléé(sL Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is

hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—
CHAPTER |
PRELIMINARY.

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Shorttitle.
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2018.

®

AT 3M3—2R9¢—%



R HERTE IH T STTERUT 9T 376, fEdaR 0, 08¢/ SRTATT RE, Ik R¥0

CHAPTER I
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MuniciPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.
Amendment of 2. In section 79 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in LIX of
section clause (g),_ 1949.
79 of LIX
1949. (a) before the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely - —

“Provided that, where the Municipal Corporation has granted
approval to the implementation of the Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana of
the Central Government on the land belonging to it, the Commissioner
shall grant lease of such land to the eligible individual beneficiary in the
manner, as may be notified by the State Government: 7,

(b) in the existing proviso, for the words “Provided that,” the words
“ Provided further that,” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER 1l

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MuniciPAL CounciLs, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND
INDUSTRIAL TOowNsHIPS AcT, 1965.

Amendment of 3. In section 92 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats Mah.
section 92 of and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall XL of
Mah. XL 1965. he inserted, namely :— 1965.

“ Provided that, where the Council has granted approval to the
implementation of the Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana of the Central Government,
on the land belonging to it, the Chief Officer shall grant lease of such land
to the eligible individual beneficiary in the manner, as may be notified by the
State Government.”.

CHAPTER IV
MiSCELLANEOUS

Power to 4. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
remove Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra LIX of
difficulty. Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, as 1949.
amended by this Act, the State Government may, as the occasion arises, by an )'\é'fr:)f
Order published in the Official Gazette, give such directions not inconsistent with ;g
the provisions of the said Acts as amended by this Act, as may appear to it to

be necessary or expedient for the purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after expiry of a period of two
years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR
GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT
DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004.
EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

HERTZ I AU
AHTEGNRUT HIT ATS

g 4, I’F R HGAR, Set *3, RO/Q/SMAUT §, Ik L]¥R [ge 2, fma : ¥0@ R9.00

STHTIARUT THHTH &4

T TR
R faurmee™ afufem @ TeauTet TEue e ARy a hetet fafraw smfor
fafe @ =m fammegs el fadas (Fush SHaE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation and the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment),
Act, 2019 (Mah. Act. No. XVIII of 2019), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XVIII OF 2019.
(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 23rd July 2019).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act and
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act.

IIl of 1888. WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal

'13<4gf Corporation Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, for the
" purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Seventieth Year

of the Republic of India as follows :—
CHAPTER |
PRELIMINARY

1. This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation and the Short title.
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations (Amendment) Act, 2019.

€3]

HIT 3MS—84 -1



R HERTZ IMEA T, FHTROT HAT A3, et 3, 0%R/STETT 2, I 2R¥Q

CHAPTER I
AMENDMENT TO Mumal MuniciPAL CORPORATION AcCT

Amendment of 2. In section 139A of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in sub- il of
szltl'%r; 11835’5? section (2), after the words “or any portion of the building”, the following 888
" words, brackets and figures shall be added, namely :—

“and building or land used for administrative or any such purposes,
by the Maharashtra State Electricity Distribution Company Limited and
its franchisees as defined in clause (27) of section 2 of the Electricity 36 of
Act, 2003 or the Maharashtra State Electricity Transmission Company 2003.
Limited but does not include buildings or lands used only for electricity
distribution infrastructure such as electrical transformers, any electrical
equipment, overhead and underground cables or such similar equipment
created or maintained by the Maharashtra State Electricity Distribution
Company Limited and such franchisees or the Maharashtra State Electricity
Transmission Company Limited”.

CHAPTER I

AMENDMENT To MAHARASHTRA MUuUNICIPAL
COoRPORATIONS AcCT

Amendment of 3. In section 128A of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in LIX of
SeC“‘(’);‘Lll)Z(SQ sub-section (2), after the words “or any portion of the building”, the following 1949

1949 Wwords, brackets and figures shall be added, namely :—

“and building or land used for administrative or any such purposes,
by the Maharashtra State Electricity Distribution Company Limited and
its franchisees as defined in clause (27) of section 2 of the Electricity 36 of
Act, 2003 or the Maharashtra State Electricity Transmission Company 2003.
Limited but does not include buildings or lands used only for electricity
distribution infrastructure such as electrical transformers, any electrical
equipment, overhead and underground cables or such similar equipment
created or maintained by the Maharashtra State Electricity Distribution
Company Limited and such franchisees or the Maharashtra State Electricity
Transmission Company Limited”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR
DR. NAMDEO KONDAJI BHOSALE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : DIRECTOR DR. NAMDEO KONDAJI BHOSALE.



RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

STHERUT HIT 3ATS

ag &, 3F wol TR, fedaw 32, 0%%/WW 20, IF 2R¥R [T 2, ffme : &0 R9.00

STATARUT HHTH 0§

UTerhd UehTeT
R fauarmee™ sfufem 7 Tt Tenfua Fed ARy F koo fatem sfor
fafe @ = faurmeea sl fadas (Fust FEE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of
India, the following translation in English of the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations (Amendment) Act, 2019 (Maharashtra Act No. XXXVI of
2019), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,
RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXXVI OF 2019.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on 31st December 2019).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal
LIXof Corporations Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted
1949. in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Short title.
(Amendment) Act, 2019.

)

YT 373 0G—2



R HERTE JTHA TS0 FHTIRUT 9T 316, fed¥aw 32, R0%%/UiN R0, Tk %%

Amendment 2. In section 5 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in sub- LIXof
ongi;:t;??gS‘lgf section (3), in the first proviso, after the words, brackets and figures “the 1949
" Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Mah.IX
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, of 2017.
2016” the words, brackets and figures “but till the day immediately preceding
the date of the publication of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Mah.

(Amendment) Act, 2019 in the Official Gazette” shall be inserted. m

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

A
HAHTIWRUT HIIT ATS
g 9, 3w ¢ FIAR, AHART 3, RORR/W R3, I LR¥R [ I 3, fewa : 9 Rw.00

SATARUT HUTEH Q
TR UhT9
TRt faurres sfifead a TuEt TEnfud Fed AR T had fattaw snfur
fafa 7 = favmmeRER st fadass (FUsTt oTEe).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Maharashtra Muncipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2020 (Mah. Act No. I of 2021), is hereby
published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

BHUPENDRA M. GURAO,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. I OF 2021

(First published, after having recived the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 13th January 2021).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act
and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and

Lﬁ( %f gﬁ‘g‘f the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
& '196§ Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore,

" promulgated the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra

Mah. Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships

Ord. X of (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 on the 2nd November 2020 ;
(*)

T AB——%



R HERTE I TSI SAATIROT WAT TS, THART €3, 0%%/UIT 13, Ik ¥R

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-first Year
of the Republic of India as follows :(—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY

Short title 1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal

and Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
commencement.

and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2020.
(2) It shall come into force on the 29th October 2020.

CHAPTER 1II
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL. CORPORATIONS ACT
Amendment of 2. In section 452A of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, LIX of
Secz‘&l 4?%*4? after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :— 1949.
(0) .

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, where
the State Election Commission has brought to the notice of the State
Government that it is not possible for the State Election Commission
to conduct the general elections to the Corporation due to outbreak of
COVID-19 pandemic in the State, then the State Government may, by
order, appoint a Government officer or officers, or extend the period
of any officer appointed under sub-section (1), for such period as may
be requested by the State Election Commission, which shall not ex-
tend beyond the 30th April 2021, to exercise all the powers and to
perform all the functions and duties of the Corporation under this

Act.”.
CHAPTER III
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,
Amendment NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL TowNsHIPS Act, 1965. Mah. XL
of section 317 3. In section 317 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar ©°f 1965.
of Mah. XL of

1965. Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, namely :—

(i) existing section shall be renumbered as sub-section (1) thereof;
and

(ii) after sub-section (I) as so re-numbered, the following
sub-section shall be added, namely :—

“(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, where
the State Election Commission has brought to the notice of the
State Government that it is not possible for the State Election
Commission to conduct the general elections to the Municipal
Council due to outbreak of COVID-19 pandemic in the State, then
the State Government may, by order, appoint a Government
officer or officers, or extend the period of any officer appointed
under sub-section (1), for such period as may be requested by the



HERTE IMTH AU FHTRUT HET S, AHART €3, 03%/MY 33, Ik 0¥

State Election Commission, which shall not extend beyond the
30th April 2021, to exercise all the powers and to perform all the
functions and duties of the Municipal Council under this Act.”.

CHAPTER 1V

MISCELLANEOUS
Mah. 4. (I) The Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra
?)?dgé(;())( Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2020, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken

(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding

LIXof provisions of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Matg‘)‘(?[; Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Town-
of 1965. Ships Act, 1965, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to
have been done, taken or, as the case may be, issued under the correspond-

ing provisions of the said Acts, as amended by this Act.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. XIX
of 2020 and
saving.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004

EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



RNI No. MAHENG /2009 / 35528

A
AJEINRIT HUIT ATS
a9, 3w R HAW, WIE 33, R0RY/IA R, T LR¥3 [ T 2, fFma : v0& R9.00

AHTINUT HHTE 3

U TehTIT
werTE faurres™ sfufem a e TEfue Fed ARy g had faftaw enfur
fafer o = favmmegA e fadad (IO o amE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2021 (Mah. Act No. VI of 2021), is
hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

BHUPENDRA M. GURAO,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VI OF 2021.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 23rd March 2021).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act
and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal
LIXof Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
i,?:}f Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter
XL of appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic

1965. of India as follows :—
CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Short title.
the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2021.

AT 3TB—3-% ®



R HERTE JITE IS0 SETERUT HAT AT, HIE 33, 0%/ R, Ik 0%3

CHAPTER 1II

AMENDMENT To THE MAHARASHTRA
MunicipAL CORPORATIONS ACT

Amendment 2. In section 452A of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, after LIX of

of section . . . . . 1949.
A52A of LIX sub-section (1A), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

of 1949, “(IB) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, where the
State Election Commission has brought to the notice of the State
Government that it is not possible for it to conduct the general elections
to the Corporation within the period specified in the order issued under
sub-section (IA), due to COVID-19 pandemic situation in the State,
then the State Government may, by order, appoint a Government officer
or officers, or extend the period of any officer appointed under
sub-section (1), for such period as may be requested by the State Election
Commission, for exercising all the powers and performing all the functions
and duties of the Corporation under this Act.”.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT To THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,
NAGAR PancHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL TownNsHIPS Act, 1965

Amendment 3, In section 317 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Mah.XL
%ffii(:ﬁ(_n;(ﬁloi Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, after sub-section (2), the °f 1965.
1965. following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

“3) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, where the State
Election Commission has brought to the notice of the State Government
that it is not possible for it to conduct the general elections to the
Municipal Council or Nagar Panchayat within the period specified in the
order issued under sub-section (2), due to COVID-19 pandemic situation
in the State, then the State Government may, by order, appoint a
Government officer or officers, or extend the period of any officer
appointed under sub-section (1), for such period as may be requested by
the State Election Commission, for exercising all the powers and
performing all the functions and duties of the Municipal Council or Nagar
Panchayat under this Act.”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004
EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



